
Northern Waterworks

Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price

Quantity

Operating 
nuts/ Nozzle 
Cap Color Quantity

Operating nuts/ 
Nozzle Cap Color

4' 6" 6

National 
Standard 1.5" 
Pentagon

Safety 
Orange

 1.5" Pent & (2) 2.5" 
+ 4.5" Red 6 $1,325.00 $7,950.00 $1,315.33 $7,891.98 $0.00 $0.00 $1,431.00 $8,586.00 $1,362.60 $8,175.60

5' 0"
Standard 1.5" 
Pentagon

Safety 
Orange

 1.5" Pent & (2) 2.5" 
+ 4.5" Red 0 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

5' 6"

National 
Standard 1.5" 
Pentagon

Safety 
Orange

 1.5" Pent & (2) 2.5" 
+ 4.5" Red 0 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

6' 0"

National 
Standard 1.5" 
Pentagon

Safety 
Orange

 1.5" Pent & (2) 2.5" 
+ 4.5" Red 0 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

6' 6"
Standard 1.5" 
Pentagon

Safety 
Orange

 1.5" Pent & (2) 2.5" 
+ 4.5" Red 0 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

7' 0" 3

National 
Standard 1.5" 
Pentagon

Safety 
Orange 1

 1.5" Pent & (2) 2.5" 
+ 4.5" Red 4 $1,470.00 $5,880.00 $1,441.52 $5,766.08 $0.00 $0.00 $1,590.00 $6,360.00 $1,514.60 $6,058.40

7' 6"
Standard 1.5" 
Pentagon

Safety 
Orange

 1.5" Pent & (2) 2.5" 
+ 4.5" Red 0 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

Totals 9 1 10

Delivery Time: 

6/9/2008

Silvis

Zimmer & Francescon

Clow Medallion 3-Way F-2545

$14,234.00

Utility Equipment

Mueller A423 Centurion

$14,946.00

Total 
Quantity

2008 Utility Supply Bid

Bury Length 

$13,830.00 $0.00

Moline

Schulte Supply
GROUP 1 - FIRE HYDRANTS

J & R Supply

Kennedy K81A

Participating Municipality

Awarded VendorNo Bid

Waterous - WB-67 Pacer

$13,658.06

30 days30 days 14 days 28 days



Size
Rock 
Island Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price

6 inch 6 gate 6 gate 12 $497.00 $5,964.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $617.00 $7,404.00 $513.25 $6,159.00

8 inch 2 gate 4 gate 6 $770.00 $4,620.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $957.00 $5,742.00 $793.55 $4,761.30

10 inch 4 gate 4 $1,125.00 $4,500.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $1,160.20 $4,640.80

10 inch 1 butterfly 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $844.00 $844.00 $1,096.60 $1,096.60

16 inch 1 butterfly 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $1,714.00 $1,714.00 $2,473.30 $2,473.30

Total 24 $15,084.00 $0.00 $0.00 $15,704.00 $19,131.00

Delivery Time:

6/9/2008

Moline 
Quantity

Total 
Quantity

Awarded Vendor

Zimmer & Francescon

Clow RW Gate Valve F-6111, 
4500 Butterfly

Utility EquipmentNorthern Waterworks

GROUP 2 - CUT IN VALVES 
J & R Supply Schulte Supply

Incomplete Bid No Bid

Kennedy 8576

No Bid

Meuller C-2360-45

30 days
Incomplete Bid

28 days30 days



Northern Waterworks

Item Quantity Quantity Quantity Quantity Quantity Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price
#6 Valve Box Lid 8 5 25 6 44 $13.25 $583.00 $11.65 $512.60 $12.75 $561.00 $6.60 $290.40 $13.50 $594.00
12" Top Section 2 2 $23.55 $47.10 $19.87 $39.74 $21.75 $43.50 $13.50 $27.00 $21.85 $43.70
18" Top Section 4 20 2 26 $34.15 $887.90 $28.77 $748.02 $31.50 $819.00 $19.60 $509.60 $31.65 $822.90
26" Top Section 6 2 10 20 6 44 $53.85 $2,369.40 $44.92 $1,976.48 $51.75 $2,277.00 $27.90 $1,227.60 $51.85 $2,281.40
12" Extension 2 10 12 $35.85 $430.20 $32.06 $384.72 $34.50 $414.00 $10.70 $128.40 $34.65 $415.80
18" Extension 4 10 3 17 $42.15 $716.55 $36.99 $628.83 $40.50 $688.50 $16.00 $272.00 $40.65 $691.05
24" Extension 2 8 10 20 $44.45 $889.00 $39.05 $781.00 $42.75 $855.00 $18.40 $368.00 $42.90 $858.00
18" Bottom Section 10 10 $35.85 $358.50 $35.14 $351.40 $34.50 $345.00 $16.00 $160.00 $26.35 $263.50
24" Bottom Section 10 10 $42.15 $421.50 $35.14 $351.40 $40.50 $405.00 $18.40 $184.00 $38.40 $384.00
30" Bottom Section 2 5 7 $45.25 $316.75 $39.73 $278.11 $43.50 $304.50 $22.50 $157.50 $42.20 $295.40
36" Bottom Section 5 2 7 $55.40 $387.80 $46.22 $323.54 $53.25 $372.75 $23.70 $165.90 $48.95 $342.65
12" slip type risers 0 $37.45 $0.00 $32.88 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
12" screw type risers 4 3 4 11 $37.45 $411.95 $32.88 $361.68 $34.50 $379.50 $19.00 $209.00 $38.10 $419.10
#6 Valve Box Base 2 2 $46.80 $93.60 $41.10 $82.20 $45.00 $90.00 $24.90 $49.80 $47.55 $95.10
TOTAL 212 $7,913.25 $6,819.72 $7,554.75 $3,749.20 $7,506.60

Delivery Time: 

Notes: Schulte Supply - 10" Top Section - spec is 12"; 16" Top Section - spec is 18"; 14" Extension - spec is 12"; 36" Extension - spec is 24"; 14" Screw Type Risers - spec is 12"
6/9/2008

This Group will not be awarded. 

GROUP 3 - VALVE BOXES

City of East 
Moline

City of 
Moline

City of 
Rock 
Island

City of 
Silvis

Total 
Quantity

Zimmer & Francescon
Tyler 6860 Series

Village of 
Carbon Cliff Tyler 6860 Series

Schulte SupplyJ & R Supply
Tyler 6860

Utility Equipment
Tyler Tyler 6860 Series

30 days30 days 7 days 30-60 days or less 21 days



Nominal 
Size

Width 
(approx.)

No. of 
Bands

Tap Size 
and type

Cast Iron Steel
Rock 
Island Moline Silvis

East 
Moline

Carbon 
Cliff

Total 
Quantity Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price

4" 7.5" 1 X 4 4 $48.40 $193.60 $44.46 $177.84 $44.78 $179.12 $36.00 $144.00 $49.00 $196.00
4" 12" 1 X 4 4 $77.50 $310.00 $68.22 $272.88 $61.23 $244.92 $55.00 $220.00 $68.00 $272.00
4" 15" 1 X 1 1 $84.65 $84.65 $75.78 $75.78 $76.35 $76.35 $68.00 $68.00 $86.15 $86.15
4" 24" 1 X 1 1 $159.50 $159.50 $146.33 $146.33 $127.72 $127.72 $139.00 $139.00 $124.50 $124.50
6" 7.5" 1 X 30 30 $58.60 $1,758.00 $51.85 $1,555.50 $47.16 $1,414.80 $37.00 $1,110.00 $54.10 $1,623.00
6" 7.5" 1 3/4" cc X 4 4 $82.00 $328.00 $70.40 $281.60 $59.12 $236.48 $62.00 $248.00 $62.25 $249.00
6" 8" 1 X 10 2 12 $58.60 $703.20 $51.85 $622.20 $47.16 $565.92 $37.00 $444.00 $54.10 $649.20
6" 12.5" 1 X 2 2 $92.95 $185.90 $83.09 $166.18 $70.00 $140.00 $63.00 $126.00 $74.40 $148.80
6" 12" 1 3/4" cc X 2 2 $116.40 $232.80 $100.74 $201.48 $81.01 $162.02 $85.00 $170.00 $82.50 $165.00
6" 15" 1 X 2 2 4 $102.50 $410.00 $91.48 $365.92 $81.40 $325.60 $76.00 $304.00 $94.40 $377.60
6" 16" 1 X 3 3 $102.50 $307.50 $91.48 $274.44 $81.40 $244.20 $76.00 $228.00 $94.40 $283.20
6" 20" 1 X 3 3 $158.60 $475.80 $143.70 $431.10 $120.97 $362.91 $110.00 $330.00 $119.55 $358.65
6" 30" 1 X 1 1 $227.00 $227.00 $205.41 $205.41 $180.56 $180.56 $183.00 $183.00 $189.40 $189.40
8" 7.5" 1 3/4" cc X 2 2 $91.55 $183.10 $83.60 $167.20 $64.26 $128.52 $62.00 $124.00 $72.40 $144.80
8" 8" 1 X 2 2 $68.15 $136.30 $60.62 $121.24 $52.67 $105.34 $45.00 $90.00 $64.40 $128.80
8" 12" 1 3/4" cc X 2 2 $132.65 $265.30 $133.79 $267.58 $86.79 $173.58 $93.00 $186.00 $93.60 $187.20
8" 15" 1 X 2 2 $125.00 $250.00 $111.30 $222.60 $91.69 $183.38 $84.00 $168.00 $112.15 $224.30
8" 20" 1 1" X 2 2 $204.05 $408.10 $193.45 $386.90 $141.81 $283.62 $140.00 $280.00 $148.75 $297.50
8" 20" 1 3/4" cc X 2 2 $204.05 $408.10 $193.45 $386.90 $141.81 $283.62 $140.00 $280.00 $148.75 $297.50

10" 7.5" 1 X 3 3 $89.60 $268.80 $78.90 $236.70 $63.48 $190.44 $60.00 $180.00 $70.10 $210.30
10" 12" 1 X 2 2 $140.30 $280.60 $123.50 $247.00 $102.50 $205.00 $99.00 $198.00 $93.25 $186.50
10" 20" 1 3/4" X 1 1 $242.25 $242.25 $209.43 $209.43 $166.40 $166.40 $177.00 $177.00 $173.15 $173.15
12" 15" 1 X 2 2 $185.65 $371.30 $170.09 $340.18 $119.29 $238.58 $125.00 $250.00 $129.65 $259.30
16" 16" 1 X 2 2 $354.60 $709.20 $422.35 $844.70 $211.12 $422.24 $225.00 $450.00 $277.55 $555.10

93 $6,641.32

Clamp Brand and Model

6/9/2008

Delivery Time: 30 days 7 days
Awarded Vendor

Smith Blair 261 - 264Cascade CR101

J & R Supply Schulte Supply Utility Equipment Zimmer & Francescon

Ford FS1 Smith-Blair 261 & 264 Powerseal 3121AS

Northern Waterworks

30-60 days or less 21 days 30 days

GROUP 4 - ALL STAINLESS WATER REPAIR CLAMPS

$6,097.00 $7,386.95$8,207.09$8,899.00

Range Sized to Fit 
O.D. for: Quantities for Participating Municipalities



Nominal Pipe Size Outside Diameter Ends
East Moline 

Quantity

Rock 
Island 

Quantity
Total 

Quantity
Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price

4" 4.80" -5.00" 6 6 $68.32 $409.92 $55.10 $330.60 $0.00 $49.00 $294.00 $64.60 $387.60
6" 6.90" - 7.22" 4 6 10 $81.28 $812.80 $80.40 $804.00 $0.00 $59.00 $590.00 $87.55 $875.50
8" 9.05" - 9.30" 6 6 $101.96 $611.76 $99.50 $597.00 $0.00 $74.00 $444.00 $112.90 $677.40
8" 9.05" - 9.45" 2 2 $101.96 $203.92 $99.50 $199.00 $0.00 $74.00 $148.00 $112.90 $225.80

10" 11.10" - 11.60" 2 2 $133.97 $267.94 $126.15 $252.30 $0.00 $129.00 $258.00 $148.10 $296.20
12" 13.20" - 13.50" 2 2 $162.87 $325.74 $151.50 $303.00 $0.00 $125.00 $250.00 $174.45 $348.90

Nominal Pipe Size Outside Diameter Ends Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price
4" 4.80" - 5.00" $168.52 $337.04 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $97.00 $194.00 $99.15 $198.30
6" 6.90" - 7.22" $197.79 $395.58 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $120.00 $240.00 $133.00 $266.00
8" 9.05" - 9.45" $288.99 $577.98 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $187.00 $374.00 $163.45 $326.90

$3,942.68 $2,485.90 $0.00 $2,792.00 $3,602.60
Notes:

3. No Bid
4. Smith Blair 441 & 442 ; Delivery 21 days

6/9/2008

Awarded Vendor

GROUP 5 - CAST COUPLINGS
STRAIGHT 

Schulte 

No BidIncomplete Bid
Note 4 Note 5 

Utility Equipment Zimmer & Francescon

1. Smith Blair 441 & 442; Delivery 7 days

Northern Waterworks J & R Supply

Moline Quantity

Note 2

LONG SLEEVE TRANSITION

2
2
2

5. Powerseal 3501; Delivery 30 days

Note 1 Note 3

2. Cascade CRCER; Incomplete Bid



Pipe Size - 
Inches

Pipe Length - 
Feet

East Moline 
Quantity

Moline 
Quantity

Rock Island 
Quantity Price/Ft. Total Price Price/Ft. Total Price Price/Ft. Total Price

6 18 3 54 11.95 $645.30 $14.13 $763.02 23.63 $1,276.02
6 20 1 5 120 $0.00 $14.13 $1,695.60 $0.00
8 18 2 36 $15.95 $574.20 $17.80 $640.80 $66.33 $2,387.88

10 18 1 18 $20.55 $369.90 $22.98 $413.64 $38.08 $685.44
10 20 4 80 $0.00 $22.98 $1,838.40 $0.00

$1,589.40 $5,351.46 $4,349.34

No Bid: Northern Waterworks; Schulte Supply
Note 1 - 18.25' long Delivery Time:
Note 2 - 20' or 18'
Note 3 - All 18' long

6/9/2008

Utility Equipment Zimmer & Francescon
GROUP 6 - DUCTILE IRON PIPE

Note 3Note 1 Note 2

Total Feet 
Requested 

Clow 
J & R Supply

30 days 14 days 5 days

Clow Griffin

Incomplete BidIncomplete Bid Awarded Vendor



Pipe Size 
Inches

# of Set 
Screws

Working 
Pressure PSI

# of 
Bolts

East 
Moline

Total 
Quantity

Unit 
Price Total Price

Unit 
Price 

Total 
Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price 

Total 
Price Unit Price Total Price

6 6 350 6 6 6 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $16.00 $96.00 $13.00 $78.00 $14.18 $85.08
8 9 250 6 4 4 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $23.00 $92.00 $20.00 $80.00 $22.00 $88.00

$0.00 $0.00 $188.00 $158.00 $173.08

Delivery Time: 

6/9/2008

Zimmer & Francescon

EBAA Tyler USA

Awarded Vendor

No brand listed EBBA #1200 

Utility Equipment

7 days 21 days 30 days

GROUP 7 - MECHANICAL JOINT DUCTILE IRON RETAINING GLANDS

No Bid No Bid

J&R Supply Schulte Supply Northern Waterworks



Pipe Size in 
Inches

OD Range in 
Inches

Moline 
Quantity

East 
Moline 

Quantity
Total 

Quantity Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price
4 4.80 - 5.00 2 2 $0.00 $0.00 $125.66 $251.32 $0.00 $0.00 $95.00 $190.00 $145.60 $291.20
6 6.90 - 7.10 2 1 3 $0.00 $0.00 $135.71 $407.13 $0.00 $0.00 $103.00 $309.00 $160.45 $481.35
8 9.05 - 9.30 2 1 3 $0.00 $0.00 $202.15 $606.45 $0.00 $0.00 $149.00 $447.00 $221.60 $664.80

10 11.10 - 11.40 1 1 $0.00 $0.00 $215.69 $215.69 $0.00 $0.00 $169.00 $169.00 $278.55 $278.55
24 25.80-26.32 1 1 $0.00 $0.00 $665.68 $665.68 $0.00 $0.00 $444.00 $444.00 $786.00 $786.00

Delivery Time: 

6/9/2008

GROUP 8 - BELL JOINT LEAK CLAMPS

$2,501.90

Schulte Supply Utility Equipment Zimmer & Francescon

Power Seal/3232 Smith Blair 274

$2,146.27

J & R Supply Northern Waterworks

Smith Blair 

$0.00
Awarded VendorNo Bid

$0.00 $1,559.00
No Bid

7-10 days 21 days 30 days



 Size in Inches Silvis Quantity Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price
6 2 $46.55 $93.10 $46.00 $92.00 $30.00 $60.00 $50.00 $100.00 $41.40 $82.80

6 2 $67.20 $134.40 $68.00 $136.00 $44.00 $88.00 $74.00 $148.00 $61.20 $122.40

6 1 $29.85 $29.85 $72.00 $72.00 $47.00 $47.00 $78.00 $78.00 $64.80 $64.80

6 1 $60.75 $60.75 $61.50 $61.50 $40.00 $40.00 $67.00 $67.00 $55.35 $55.35

Delivery Time:

6/9/2008

Awarded vendor
$393.00$318.10 $361.50 $235.00

Tyler C 153 Compact Tyler USA Tyler SSB MJ fittings

SOLID SLEEVE - LONG

90 DEGREE BEND

J & R Supply 
Tyler

Zimmer & Francescan Norther Waterworks Utility Equipment
SOLID SLEEVE - SHORT

30-60 days or less

GROUP 9 - MECHANICAL JOINT SSB - DUCTILE IRON CLASS 350 FITTINGS

30 days 7 days 14 days 30 days

Schulte Supply 
Tyler Class 153

$325.35

11 1/4 DEGREE BEND



Unit Price 
Total 
Price Unit Price 

Total 
Price Unit Price 

Total 
Price Unit Price 

Total 
Price Unit Price 

Total 
Price

4 4 $0.00 $0.00 $23.50 $94.00 $18.71 $74.84 $21.50 $86.00 $20.50 $82.00
6 6 $0.00 $0.00 $28.55 $171.30 $22.82 $136.92 $26.30 $157.80 $24.75 $148.50
8 6 $0.00 $0.00 $39.78 $238.68 $32.41 $194.46 $36.30 $217.80 $35.15 $210.90
10 4 $0.00 $0.00 $57.43 $229.72 $47.51 $190.04 $52.40 $209.60 $51.20 $204.80
12 4 $0.00 $0.00 $77.85 $311.40 $66.06 $264.24 $71.00 $284.00 $70.75 $283.00

Delivery Time:

6/9/2008

Zimmer & Francescon
Tyler MJ Field Lock EBBA #1100 US Pipe MJ Field Lock Kit Tyler Field Lock USA

J&R Supply Schulte Supply Northern Waterworks Utility Equipment

14 days 30 days

GROUP 10  - MECHANICAL JOINT RESTRAINT

MOLINE 
QUANTITY

NOMINAL PIPE SIZE 
IN INCHES

$0.00 $1,045.10 $860.50 $955.20 $929.20
Awarded VendorNo Bid

30-60 days 5 days


